
18v Battery Trade In Offer Terms & Conditions  
 
 
Participation in this Trade in Offer is deemed acceptance of these Terms and Conditions. 

Promoter 
2. This redemption is run by Bunnings Group Limited (ABN 26 008 672 179) of Botanicca 3 – Level 2 
East Tower, 570 Swan Street, Burnley, Victoria 3121 (Bunnings). 

The redemption is only open to eligible claimants. An “Eligible Claimant” is a person or business who: 

a. is either an Australian citizen or a resident. 

b. brings a 18v battery into a Bunnings store for trade-in; and 

c. purchases the relevant qualifying product/s from Bunnings (in-store) in Australia, during the 
Promotion Period. 

Redemption and promotion period 
3.Individual redemption offer details will be provided on Bunnings’ website from time to time. Each 
redemption offer may be subject to specific or additional terms and conditions, including expiry 
periods. Each redemption offer applies only to the products and transaction periods specified for the 
offer. 

4.The redemption purchase period commences on 14 September 2024 and closes at 11:59pm AEST 
on 13 October 2024 for qualifying transactions (Promotion Period). 

Redemption offers 
5. Claimants can only claim the Redemption Offer in-store from Bunnings in Australia, during the 
Promotion Period. Expired redemption offers are not redeemable. 

6.Should stock not be available at all Bunnings stores, stock may be ordered. 

7. The Redemption Offer is eligible with the purchase of: 

1.  Item number 0585251 -BATTERY CHARGER TOOL RYOBI HP STARTER W/8.0ah R18SK18 ;  

2. Item number 0590314 BATTERY POWER TOOL OZITO PXC 18V 5.2ah TWIN PACK PXTB-252  

(Qualifying Product). 

8. To redeem the offer, an Eligible Claimant must, during the Promotion Period, bring a 18v battery 
into a Bunnings store to trade-in in order to receive one (1) $50 discount on the purchase of a 
Qualifying Product. 

9. Only one Redemption Offer can be redeemed per one (1)18v battery that is traded in along with the 
purchase of one (1) Qualifying Product. For example, an Eligible Claimant cannot redeem more than 
one $50 discount for the purchase of one (1) Qualifying Product.  But an Eligible Claimant can 
redeem a $100 discount (but no more) for the purchase of two (2) Qualifying Products if two (2) 18v 
batteries have been traded in. 

10. Except where the statutory consumer guarantees as provided under the Competition and 
Consumer Act provide the customer with a remedy under that Act: 



(a) products purchased with the Redemption Offer may only be returned for a replacement or an 
exchange voucher to the extent that the Redemption Offer applies to a refund; and 

(b) where products purchased to generate a Redemption Offer are returned by the customer, those 
products may only be returned for a replacement or an exchange voucher to the extent that the 
Redemption Offer applies to a refund. 

Applicable products 

11. This offer only applies to the purchase of the Qualifying Product  

1.Item 0585251 -BATTERY CHARGER TOOL RYOBI HP STARTER W/8.0ah R18SK18 ;  

2. Item number 0590314 BATTERY POWER TOOL OZITO PXC 18V 5.2ah TWIN PACK PXTB-252 

(Qualifying Product). 

12. The Redemption Offer excludes any battery that is not an 18v battery, any replicas of the 
Qualifying Product/s or toy batteries. 

How to redeem a redemption offer 
13. To be eligible for the redemption offer, a claimant must: (a) Make a Qualifying Transaction from 
Bunnings (in-store) in Australia during the Promotion Period. 

14. Bunnings-issued redemption offers are only redeemable in-store at Bunnings, and Bunnings does 
not accept redemption offers promoted by other retailers or suppliers. 

General 
15. Bunnings may require claimants to provide further information regarding the circumstances of the 
product purchases as part of the entry verification process. Failure to provide this information to 
Bunnings’ satisfaction may result in an invalid application. 

16. Redemption Offers are not transferable, cannot be re-sold and cannot be taken as cash. 

17. Bunnings reserves the right, at any time, to substitute a Qualifying Product to a product of 
equivalent value, subject to legislation, at its discretion in the event that a Qualifying Product is 
unavailable for reasons beyond its control. 

18. Bunnings reserves the right to change, suspend or cancel this Redemption Offer at any time. 

19. Bunnings reserves the right to decline redemption of this offer, if it determines, at its sole 
discretion, that a trade-in battery is excluded. 

Privacy 
20. Bunnings collects personal information in connection with redemption offers in order to administer 
the promotion and in accordance with its Privacy Policy (available 
at https://www.bunnings.com.au/policies/privacy-policy). Bunnings uses and discloses such 
information to third parties, including, for example, suppliers and delivery contractors, in connection 
with the operation of these redemption offers, and as otherwise described in its Privacy Policy. 
 
Liability 
21. Nothing in these Terms and Conditions limits, excludes, or modifies or purports to limit, exclude or 
modify the statutory consumer guarantees as provided under the Competition and Consumer Act, as 
well as any other implied warranties that are incapable of being excluded (Non-Excludable 
Guarantees). Except for any liability that cannot by law be excluded, including the Non-Excludable 
Guarantees, Bunnings (including its respective officers, employees, and agents) excludes all liability 

https://www.bunnings.com.au/policies/privacy-policy


(including negligence), for any personal injury; or any loss or damage (including loss of opportunity); 
whether direct, indirect, special, or consequential, arising in any way out of any Redemption Offer. 
 
Governing Law 
22. The laws of Victoria, Australia apply to this redemption to the exclusion of any other law. 
Claimants submit to the exclusive jurisdiction of the courts of Victoria, Australia. 

 


